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Fight against Renzi 
- or disappear 
by Ida Magli 
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“Forza Italia does not have a strategy” Mr. Bondi said? Forza Italia (the 
party of Berlusconi) has no more strength, and nothing is left of the 
things for which it was born. No thought nor soul, no intelligence, no 
eyes to see, or ears to hear. In fact they did not realize that we are living 
under a dictatorship since several years.  

Where are the Liberals and the Moderates they talk so much about? If 
you support mr. Renzi, you are not a liberal nor a moderate. There is no 
freedom nor democracy in a country where all the money we spend 
every day is counted and checked in the bank accounts. What is the 
difference between this and the internal passports of the old Soviet 
regime? Instead of the the passport it is the number of coins that 
determines how far you can go.  

"Through money you will imprison them": this is the basic rule of 
Brussels; it was enforced by the best performers of Italy: Monti, Letta, 
Renzi. Bondi cannot understand this because, like the rest of Forza Italia, 
he fell into an abyss of depression. Don’t you see that Renzi seems so 
active just because you do not move anymore? You do not dare to think 
or act, to come up with an idea. You can just repeat the same old story 
about the debts that have to be paid, the Maastricht treaty that must be 
obeyed. You do not have any self confidence and you do not trust the 
intelligence of the Italians.  

Your party is abandoned into passivity and immobility only because your 
boss can not lead you to the victory as he did before? Mr. Bondi does not 
understand that Forza Italia must act instead, showing its energies, and 
that this can be done only fighting? If Forza Italia is just the spare wheel 
of mr. Renzi, it will not create or win anything and will attract only gray, 
weak people - the same as they are. In order to fight, you must be in 
the opposition, and have an enemy: there are no alternatives. the Right 
has disappeared because it did not realize that marxism is here, with the 
primacy of economic structures, of Finance. 
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There is no need of an explicit battle against capitalism, of of the 
elimination of the bourgeoisie. This happened during the first and rough 
first phases of marxism, especially in the Soviet Union. But in the 
european world, that is convinced of its  its absolute democracy, and 
believes that nothing can endanger its freedom, all this became so 
"obvious" that it was possible to put the rope around our neck: we did 
not realize it, nor did mr. Bondi. 

The rope is precisely the economic and financial dictatorship. Renzi 
needs a vote of confidence to pass his own laws? Nothing is more 
democratic: you can not stop the Def (the government Decree on 
Economy and Finance). Mr. Padoan (minister of Economy and Finance) is 
convinced that there is still some money hidden under the mattress, and 
is cross-checking the data of all the money Italians earn and spend? 
Very very well, finally we will win over the Dodgers, the modern 
incarnation of the Devil! The Holy Inquisition was sure that the devils 
were hidden in the hair of the witches, but rightly they believed that a 
zero haircut was not enough: they also shaved their pubic hair. Mr. 
Bondi, be brave! say a word in defense of the private life of the Italians; 
defend the primacy of the person over the State and the taxes. Do not 
bow your head anymore: fight - or die. 
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